COMPANY BIDDING:_Krueger International, Inc.

ATTACHMENT A

Invitation to Bid (ITB) 6904 OF

VALUE-ADDED FURNITURE KITS AND COMPONENTS FOR CORRECTIONAL INDUSTRIES

QTY25-49 | qrys50+ UNIT
UNIT PRICE PRICE
VOLUME
ANNUAL ( VOLUME PERIOD OF IF BIDDING ALTERNATIVE OR EQUIVALENT ITEM, PLEASE STATE
LINE QTY 1-24 PRICING PER ( MODEL/ PRODUCT LINE Q
p DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED |  UOM UNITPRICE | unireon | PRICING PER MANUFACTURER NAME WARRANTY DIFFERENCES AND ATTACH PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS TO BID
USAGE LARGER |UNIT FOR LARGER COVERAGE PACKAGE.
QuanTiTy | QUANTITY
ORDER) ORDER)
EVALUATED CORE ITEMS Lines 1-24
OFFICE CHAIRS, STOOLS, STACKING, & TASK SEATING
L |oE1ITHACA, ADIUSTABLE TASK ARMS AND SEAT SLIDER SOUNITS A $202.29 s286.44 $280.60 on OEI64/JR39/SLDINF/C (OEI 10 years
KIT PRICE Ithaca)
, |OFIITHACA, ADJUSTABLE PIVOT ARMS AND SEAT SLIDER SOUNITS A $373.36 $365.89 $356.43 on OEI64/JR69/SLDINF/C (OEI 10 years
KIT PRICE Ithaca)
OFI BREATHE CHAIR WITH ADJUSTABLE ARMS CIBRTH.P.NABLKD &
3 |KITPRICE 800 UNITS EA $340.20 $333.40 $326.59 OEI CI.BRTH.AARMSET BL (OE! 10 years
COMES WITH MESH BACK UUPHOLSTERY & SEAT CUSHION FABRIC Breathe)
OFI BREATHE CHAIR WITH ADJUSTABLE ARMS AND HEADREST CLBRTH.P.NABLKD &
KIT PRICE CI.BRTH.AARMSET.BL &
4 387.15 379.41 371.66 OEI 10
COMES WITH MESH BACK UUPHOLSTERY & SEAT CUsHION Fagric | 200 UNITS EA $ $ $ CI.BRTH.HEADREST.BL (OEI years
Breathe)
OFI PILOT XL CHAIR, 24/7, DUTY BELT, B&T, BREAKAWAY ARM CLPILOTURPDLAUBL (OF!
5 |KITPRICE 30 UNITS EA $587.18 $575.44 $563.69 OEI : Pt ( 10 years
MUST BE WEIGHT-RATED FOR MINIMUM 350 LBS
OF! PILOT XL CHAIR, 24/7, DUTY BELT, B&T, FULLY ADJUST CLPILOTIKRI0OUBL (OF!
6 [KITPRICE 20 UNITS EA $540.86 $530.04 $519.23 OEI : Piot) ( 10 years
MUST BE WEIGHT-RATED FOR MINIMUM 350 LBS
7 ZETI ::{ngg stoot 25 UNITS EA $403.14 $395.08 $387.01 OEI CILPLTSTLINA/S (OEI Pilot) 10 years
o |OEI NAVIGATOR CHAIR WITHOUT ARMS, NESTING 250 UNITS A s141.65 s136.62 s135.98 ol CI-TGNAUBIUS/XJSXXIC (OE! 10 yoars
KIT PRICE Navigator)
OFI NAVIGATOR CHAIR WITHOUT ARMS, CHROME LEGS, NESTING CI-TGNAUB/US/CHISXX/C
S [ pmce 75 UNITS EA $141.65 $138.82 $135.98 OEI (OF Navigator 10 years
OFT NAVIGATOR CHAIR WITH ARMS, CHROME LEGS, CASTERS, AIR o
10 [NESTING 50 UNITS EA $154.01 $150.93 $147.85 OEI TGWAUB/US/CHISXXIAXX/C 10 years
KIT PRICE (OEI Navigator)
OEI NAVIGATOR CHAIR, AIR NESTING, WITHOUT ARMS, CASTER CI-TANNA/XX/XXMH/S (OEI
Tl 10 UNITS EA $188.91 $185.13 $181.35 OEI Navigator A 10 years
OFI NAVIGATOR CHAIR, AIR NESTING, WITHOUT ARMS, GLIDE CI-TANNA/XX/XXMH/G (OEI
TN b 10 UNITS EA $191.75 $187.92 $184.08 OEI Navigator A 10 years
1s |OFI NAVIGATOR CHAIR, AIR NESTING, WITH ARMS, CASTER LOUNITS. . $206.09 s201.97 $197.65 ol CI-TANWA/XX/XXMHIS (OEI 10 yoars

KIT PRICE

Navigator Air)
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QTyY 25-49

QTY 50+ UNIT
UNIT PRICE PRICE
VOLUME
ANNUAL ( VOLUME PERIOD OF IF BIDDING ALTERNATIVE OR EQUIVALENT ITEM, PLEASE STATE
LINE QTY 1-24 PRICING PER ( MODEL/ PRODUCT LINE Q
p DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED |  UOM UNITPRICE | unireon | PRICING PER MANUFACTURER NAME WARRANTY DIFFERENCES AND ATTACH PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS TO BID
USAGE LARGER |UNIT FOR LARGER COVERAGE PACKAGE.
QuanTiTy | QUANTITY
ORDER) ORDER)
OFI NAVIGATOR CHAIR, AIR NESTING, WITH ARMS, GLIDE CI-TANWAXX/XXMH/G (OEI
ETIN b 10 UNITS EA $208.93 $204.75 $200.57 OEI Nevigator A 10 years
SAMPLE MODEL AVAILABLE:
OFI SITKA SEATING COLLECTION WITH ALL ASSORTED SIZES AND SITKA PRICE LIST DATED 6/28/2024 CONTAINS ALL OPTIONS AVAILABLE(VOLUME
15 |0 riEs O EQUIVALENT 250 UNITS EA $135.30 $132.59 $129.89 OEI CI-GLNAP/S>i<t>;/aP)XX/F (OEI 10 years PRICING OF 2% DISCOUNT For 26,49 QTVS AND 45% DISCOUNT FOR 505 QY
SAMPLE MODEL AVAILABLE: ITHACA ULTRA PRICE LIST DATED 6/28/2024 CONTAINS ALL OPTIONS
16 ESQE?YLEIE-E?RS;ASII\V;LEE;LECTION WITH ALL ASSORTED SIZES 75 UNITS EA $265.28 $259.97 $254.67 OEI OEI74/NA/NF/SLD/BL/C (OEI 10 years AVAILABLE(VOLUME PRICING OF 2% DISCOUNT FOR 25-49 QTY'S AND 4%
Q Ithaca Ultra) DISCOUNT FOR OVER 50+ QTY'S)
SAMPLE MODEL AVAILABLE: SHIBBY PRICE LIST DATED 6/28/2024 CONTAINS ALL OPTIONS AVAILABLE(VOLUME
17 |OF! SHIBBY MODULAR SEATING COLLECTION WITH ALLASSORTED | )\ i EA $745.22 $730.32 $715.41 OEI H33KD/XX/HNG/NGL (OE| 10 years PRICING OF 2% DISCOUNT FOR 25-49 QTY'S AND 4% DISCOUNT FOR OVER 50+
SIZES AND STYLES OR EQUIVALENT ! y
Shibby) ars)
PIPER PRICE LIST DATED 6/28/2024 CONTAINS ALL OPTIONS AVAILABLE(VOLUME
OFI PIPER GUEST SEATING COLLECTION WITH ALL ASSORTED SIZES SAMPLE MODEL AVAILABLE:
18 . . X . PRICING OF 2% DISCOUNT FOR 25-49 QTY'S AND 4% DISCOUNT FOR OVER 50
D SrYLE% OR EQUNVALENT 100 UNITS EA $50.84 $49.82 $48.81 OEI CLMSNG/XXPYX (OF! Piper) 10 years P a -
OFI 600 SERIES FOLDING CHAIRS COLLECTION WITH ALL ASSORTED B01FCIXX/IXXF (OEI 600 Series
19 ! : X N ¢
SIZES AND STYLES OR EQUIVALENT SOUNITS EA $48.00 $47.04 $46.08 OEl Folding Chair) 10 years
20 |ICF DELTA CHAIR KIT 125 UNITS EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
21 ICF COMFORT RX CHAIR KIT 45 UNITS EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NIGHTINGALE
22 KHROMA CHAIR KIT, KITS PRE-UPHOLSTERED 25 UNITS EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BLACK VINYL
23 |TRANSPORT DOLLY, NONGANGING, ARMLESS, SUNITS EA $165.38 $162.07 $158.76 OEI CSD.BL (OE! Piper) 10 years
24 |TRANSPORT DOLLY, ARM CHAIR SUNITS EA $165.38 $162.07 $158.76 OEI MFSD.BL (OEI Piper) 10 years
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LINE

DESCRIPTION

ANNUAL
ESTIMATED
USAGE

uom

QTY 2549 | qrys50+ UNIT
UNIT PRICE PRICE

(VOLUME (VOLUME

TY 124
Q PRICING PER | ppicinG PER MANUFACTURER
UNITPRICE | UNITFOR | 0 o R
LARGER
QuanTITY | QUANTITY
ORDER) ORDER)

MODEL/ PRODUCT LINE
NAME

PERIOD OF
WARRANTY
COVERAGE

IF BIDDING ALTERNATIVE OR EQUIVALENT ITEM, PLEASE STATE
DIFFERENCES AND ATTACH PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS TO BID
PACKAGE.

NON-EVALUATED CATALOG PRODUCT LINES
Non-Evaluated

Items identified as Catalog/Non-Core Items are to be represented by a Catalog or Current Manufacturer's Price List(s) containing items not called out as Core items on this Document.

A link to the Catalog or Current Manufacturer's Price list(s) should accompany each submitted bid.

LATERAL FILES, PEDESTALS, VERTICAL FILES, & BOOKCASES

Estimated
Usage

uom

State % of Discount

State Catalog or Provide Catalog Website Link:

OEI SERIES XX1 OR EQUIVALENT

FILING CABINET, VERTICAL, LETTER-KITS, WITH ALL ASSORTED
SIZES, DRAWER OPTIONS, STYLES

Kits, without counterbalance weights

Shell is painted, ready to assemble

Locks come with

Inset handles

Pulls

22 Gauge Cold Rolled Steel or equivalent (CRS)

Various Drawer Configurations

40 UNITS

EA

0__% DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG

(ALL OEI PRICING IS NET, FOB DESTINATION)

FOUND IN OEI SERIES XXI PRODUCT LINE ON THE PRICE LIST NAMED "VERTICALS (LEVEL 1)".

OEI SERIES XX1 OR EQUIVALENT

FILING CABINET, VERTICAL, LEGAL-KITS, WITH ALL ASSORTED SIZES,
DRAWER OPTIONS, STYLES

Kits, without counterbalance weights

Shell is painted, ready to assemble

Locks come with

Inset handles

Pulls

22 Gauge Cold Rolled Steel or equivalent (CRS)

Various Drawer Configurations

20 UNITS

EA

0__% DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG

(ALL OEI PRICING IS NET, FOB DESTINATION)

FOUND IN OEI SERIES XXI PRODUCT LINE ON THE PRICE LIST NAMED "VERTICALS (LEVEL 1)".

OEI SERIES XX1 OR EQUIVALENT

FILING CABINET, PEDESTAL, MOBILE-KITS, WITH ALL ASSORTED
SIZES DRAWER OPTIONS, STYLES, AND ACCESSORIES

Kits, without counterbalance weights

Shell is painted, ready to assemble

Locks come with

Inset handles

Pulls

22 Gauge Cold Rolled Steel or equivalent (CRS)

Various Drawer Configurations

50 UNITS

EA

0__% DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG

(ALL OEI PRICING IS NET, FOB DESTINATION)

FOUND IN OEI SERIES XXI PRODUCT LINE ON THE PRICE LIST NAMED "PEDESTALS (LEVEL 1)".

OEI SERIES XX1 OR EQUIVALENT

FILING CABINET, PEDESTAL, FREESTAND-KITS, WITH ALL ASSORTED
SIZES DRAWER OPTIONS, STYLES, AND ACCESSORIES

Kits, without counterbalance weights

Shell is painted, ready to assemble

Locks come with

Inset handles

Pulls

22 Gauge Cold Rolled Steel or equivalent (CRS)

Various Drawer Configurations

30 UNITS

EA

0__% DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG

(ALL OEI PRICING IS NET, FOB DESTINATION)

FOUND IN OEI SERIES XXI PRODUCT LINE ON THE PRICE LIST NAMED "PEDESTALS (LEVEL 1)".

OEI SERIES XX1 OR EQUIVALENT

FILING CABINET, PEDESTAL, HANGING-KITS, WITH ALL ASSORTED
SIZES, DRAWER OPTIONS, STYLES Kits, without counterbalance
weights

Shell is painted, ready to assemble

Locks come with

Inset handles

Pulls

22 Gauge Cold Rolled Steel or equivalent (CRS)

20 UNITS

EA

0__% DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG

(ALL OEI PRICING IS NET, FOB DESTINATION)

FOUND IN OEI SERIES XXI PRODUCT LINE ON THE PRICE LIST NAMED "PEDESTALS (LEVEL 1)".
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QTyY 25-49

QTY 50+ UNIT
UNIT PRICE PRICE
ANNUAL (VOLUME (VOLUME PERIOD OF IF BIDDING ALTERNATIVE OR EQUIVALENT ITEM, PLEASE STATE
L':E DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED | UOM u?anY ::I::E P'S:'I:‘;::R PRICING PER MANUFACTURER MODEL/ :,mw LINE WARRANTY DIFFERENCES AND ATTACH PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS TO BID
USAGE LARGER |UNIT FOR LARGER COVERAGE PACKAGE.
QuanTiTy | QUANTITY
ORDER) ORDER)
OFI SERIES XX1 OR EQUIVALENT
PRECONFIGURED LATERAL FILING CABINETS-KITS, WITH ALL
ASSORTED SIZES, DRAWER OPTIONS, STYLES, ACCESSORIES
Kits, without counterbalance weights
Shell is painted, ready to assemble
Locks come with
Inset handies 0__ % DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG . .
30 |pyiis 50 UNITS EA FOUND IN OEI SERIES XXI PRODUCT LINE ON THE PRICE LIST NAMED "LATERALS (LEVEL 1)".
ne : (ALL OEI PRICING IS NET, FOB DESTINATION)
auge Cold Rolled Steel or equivalent (CRS)
Standard widths 30, 36, 42
Depths 18"
Various Heights
OFI SERIES XX1 OR EQUIVALENT 0__% DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG . .
31 |BOOKCASE-KITS, WITH ALL ASSORTED SIZES, SHELF OPTIONS, 30 UNITS EA - FOUND IN OEI SERIES XXI PRODUCT LINE ON THE PRICE LIST NAMED "BOOKCASES (LEVEL 1)".

STYLES, AND ACCESSORIES

(ALL OEI PRICING IS NET, FOB DESTINATION)
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QTY25-49 | qrys0+ UNIT
UNIT PRICE PRICE
(VOLUME
ANNUAL (VOLUME PERIOD OF IF BIDDING ALTERNATIVE OR EQUIVALENT ITEM, PLEASE STATE
L':E DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED | UOM U?\‘T; ::I::E P'S:'I:‘;::R PRICING PER MANUFACTURER MODEL/ ’:iﬁnzua LINE WARRANTY DIFFERENCES AND ATTACH PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS TO BID
USAGE LARGER |UNIT FOR LARGER COVERAGE PACKAGE.
QUANTITY QUANTITY
ORDER) ORDER)
Estimated . . L
TABLES, DESKING SYSTEMS, & COMPONENTS Usage uom State % of Discount State Catalog or Provide Catalog Website Link:
OEI OR EQUIVALENT KI UNIFRAME LIST PRICE BOOK DATED NOVEMBER 1, 2023 (OEI IS A
32 |UNIFY CAFETERIA TABLES, PERFECT EDGE, BLACK, AND CHROME 30 UNITS EA _55 % DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG
WITH ALL ASSORTED SIZES AND STYLES MARKETING/SALES DIVISION OF KI)
OEI OR EQUIVALENT ____0__% DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG
33 75 UNITS EA FOUND IN OEI ULTRALITE PRODUCT LINE ON THE PRICE LIST NAMED "ULTRALITE".
ULTRALITE TABLES WITH ALL ASSORTED SIZES AND STYLES (ALL OEI PRICING IS NET, FOB DESTINATION)
OEI OR EQUIVALENT 0__ % DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG
34 |DEVELOP BASE TABLES COLLECTION 9INCLUDES: A, E, L, P, R, T, W 250 UNITS EA — FOUND IN OEI DEVELOP PRODUCT LINE ON THE PRICE LIST NAMED "DEVELOP TABLE BASES".
BASES) WITH ALL ASSORTED SIZES AND STYLES (ALL OEI PRICING IS NET, FOB DESTINATION)
OFI OR EQUIVALENT 0__% DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG
35 |T-4 ADJUSTABLIE HEIGHT RETURN AND FIXED 25 UNITS EA - FOUND IN OEI T-4 PRODUCT LINE ON THE PRICE LIST NAMED "T-4".
(ALL OEI PRICING IS NET, FOB DESTINATION)
OFI OR EQUIVALENT 0__% DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG
36 |FLEXSTATION DESKING SYSTEM COLLECTION WITH ALL ASSORTED 35 UNITS EA - FOUND IN OEI FLEXSTATION PRODUCT LINE ON THE PRICE LIST NAMED "FLEXSTATION".
SIZES AND STYLES (ALL OEI PRICING IS NET, FOB DESTINATION)
OEl OR EQUIVALENT 0__ % DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG
37 |FACETIME WAVE CLASSROOM FURNITURE COLLECTION WITH ALL 100 UNITS EA — FOUND IN OEI FACETIME WAVE PRODUCT LINE ON THE PRICE LIST NAMED "FACETIME WAVE".
ASSORTED SIZES AND STYLES (ALL OEI PRICING IS NET, FOB DESTINATION)
OEI OR EQUIVALENT ____0__% DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG
38 35 UNITS EA FOUND IN OEI LED LIGHTS PRODUCT LINE ON THE PRICE LIST NAMED "LED LIGHTS".
LED TASK LIGHTS WITH ALL ASSORTED SIZES AND STYLES (ALL OEI PRICING IS NET, FOB DESTINATION)
4o |OF1 OR EQUIVALENT LOUNITS A 0__% DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG FOUND IN OEI KEYBOARD MECHANISMS & TABLE ACCESSORIES PRODUCT LINE ON THE PRICE LIST
CPU HOLDERS WITH ALL ASSORTED SIZES AND STYLES (ALL OEI PRICING IS NET, FOB DESTINATION) NAMED "KEYBOARD MECHANISMS & TABLE ACCESSORIES".
HUMANSCALE OR EQUIVALENT
40 [SIT-STAND MONITOR LIFT PRODUCT LINE WITH ALL ASSORTED 125 UNITS EA % DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG N O BID
SIZES AND STYLES
BAY PRODUCTS OR EQUIVALENT
41 [POWERUP ELECTRICAL COLLECTION AND ACCESSORIES WITH ALL 75 UNITS EA % DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG N O B| D
ASSORTED SIZES AND STYLES
OEI OR EQUIVALENT 0__% DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG FOUND IN OEI DEVELOP PRODUCT LINE ON THE PRICE LIST NAMED "DEVELOP TABLE BASES
42 [ACTIV8 SYSTEM AND ACCESSSORIES WITH ALL ASSORTED SIZES 25 UNITS EA —

AND STYLES

(ALL OEI PRICING IS NET, FOB DESTINATION)

COMPONENTS".
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QTY 2549 | qryso+ UNIT
UNIT PRICE PRICE
(VOLUME
ANNUAL (VOLUME PERIOD OF IF BIDDING ALTERNATIVE OR EQUIVALENT ITEM, PLEASE STATE
L':E DESCRIPTION ESTIMATED |  UOM U?\‘T; ::I::E P'S:'I:‘;::R PRICING PER MANUFACTURER MODEL/ :i&zua LINE WARRANTY DIFFERENCES AND ATTACH PRODUCT SPECIFICATIONS TO BID
USAGE LARGER UNIT FOR LARGER! COVERAGE PACKAGE.
QUANTITY QUANTITY
ORDER) ORDER)
PANEL SYSTEMS Es:ji:;ag:ed uom State % of Discount State Catalog or Provide Catalog Website Link:
43 |OF OR EQUIVALENT S UNITS A 0__ % DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG FOUND IN OEI LEGION AND SYSTEM XXI PRODUCT LINES ON THE PRICE LISTS NAMED "LEGION or
PANEL SYSTEMS (ALL OEI PRICING IS NET, FOB DESTINATION) SYSTEM XXI".
OTHER FURNITURE LINES Es:j:::d uom State % of Discount State Catalog or Provide Catalog Website Link:
0__% DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG | ADDITIONAL OEI SEATING LINES/PRICE LISTS: ALT3, ATTAIN, BENEFIT, BREATHE JR., ETSAME, FACETIME
44 |OFFICE & TASK SEATING NOT LISTED ABOVE 25 UNITS EA
(ALL OEI PRICING IS NET, FOB DESTINATION) WAVE, KETAK, OCCUPY, RIGGER4, SNAP, STRATMOSPHERE, SUM4, SUTIL
0__% DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG ADDITIONAL OEI STOOL SEATING LINES/PRICE LISTS: ATTAIN, BREATHE, FACETIME WAVE, KETAK,
45 |OFFICE & TASK STOOLS NOT LISTED ABOVE 25 UNITS EA
(ALL OEI PRICING IS NET, FOB DESTINATION) RIGGER4, OCCUPY, SNAP, SUM4, SUTIL
NIGHTINGALE OR EQUIVALENT
46 |KHROMA SEATING LINE 50 UNITS EA % DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG N O BI D
ALTERNATIVE MODELS
47 |UPHOLSTERED LOUNGE OR COMMON AREAS FURNITURE J0UNITS A ___0__% DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG ADDITIONAL OEI STOOL SEATING LINES/PRICE LISTS: ATTAIN, BREATHE, FACETIME WAVE, KETAK,
(ALL OEI PRICING IS NET, FOB DESTINATION) RIGGER4, OCCUPY, SNAP, SUM4, SUTIL
0__% DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG | ADDITIONAL OEl MODULAR FURNITURE SYSTEMS/PRICE LISTS: ACCLIMATE, REFUGE, VINI, STYLELINKS,
48 |MODULAR FURNITURE SYSTEMS 20 UNITS EA
(ALL OEI PRICING IS NET, FOB DESTINATION) VOLITION
w0 |rasLe BASES 25 UNITS A 0__% DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG ADDITIONAL OEI TABLE BASES/PRICE LISTS FOUND IN OUR DEVELOP TABLE BASES AND UNIFY PRICE
(ALL OEI PRICING IS NET, FOB DESTINATION) LISTS
OTHER MATERIALS USED IN MANUFACTURING / ASSEMBLING
50 |OFFICE FURNITURE 25 UNITS EA % DISCOUNT OFF PRICE LIST/CATALOG N O BI D
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